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From: "Lang, Sebastian" <sebastian.lang@communication-summit.eu>
To: leva Véjalyté <ieva.vejalyte@sumin.lt>,

Dear leva,
Sure thing. The price for two participants including all taxes is 3885,31€. (1690€+1521€ + 674,31€).
Is that enough? Do you send over a contract that we sign?

Best,
Sebastian

Von: Ieva Véjalyté [mailto:ieva.vejalyte@sumin.lt]
Gesendet: Dienstag, 24. Mai 2016 06:38

An: Lang, Sebastian

Betreff: Re: AW: Incuiry about European Communication Summit 2016

Dear Sebastian,

Because of the procurement procedures, firstly we need to receive the official proposal for two persons with
prices including all taxes.

After that we will need to receive a contract and two different invoices for each person.

Thank you for the understanding.

Sincerely
Ieva Véjalyté
Chief Specialist of Personnel Administration Division

Ministry of Transport and Communications
of the Republic of Lithuania

Phone +370 5 239 3962

Siame praneime esanti informacija yra skirta tik asmeniui, kuriam ji yra adresuojama. ir jg priimti jgaliotiems asmenims, Prane3ime gali biti konfidenciali ar
vie3al neskelbiama informacija. Jeigu $is praneSimas néra skirtas Jums, atskleisti, naudoti, kopijuoti ar platinti §j praneimg yra draudziama. Jeigu §is pranesimas
néra skirtas Jums, pradome apie tai informuoti siuntéjg ir prane$img nedelsiant sunaikinti.
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Dear leva,

Thanks for your mail. Both are already registered, please see attached. This also has all prices as well
as the tax of 21%.

Hope this helps.

Best
Sebastian

Von: Ieva Véjalyté [mailto:ieva.vejalyte@sumin.lt]

Gesendet: Montag, 23. Mai 2016 10:47

An: Lang, Sebastian

Betreff: Incuiry about European Communication Summit 2016

Dear Sebastian,

Two person from Ministry of Transport and Communications of the Republic of Lithuania are
planning to participate in the forthcoming conference ,European Communication Summit
2016“ which will take place in Brussels on 7th-8th of July 2016.

Could you please send us a proposal with a final conference programme and price including
all taxes for two persons.

Look forward to hearing from you.

Ieva Véjalyte

Chief Specialist of Personnel Administration Division
Ministry of Transport and Communications

of the Republic of Lithuania

Phone +370 5 239 3962

thttp://www.sumin.lt
Pagarbiai

Ieva VEJALYTE

Lietuvos Respublikos susisiekimo ministerijos
Personalo administravimo skyriaus
vyriausioji specialisté

Tel. (8 5) 239 3962

http://www.sumin.lt
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